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.DESCRIPTION AND USES                              . 

RockSolid
®
 Heavy Duty Cleaner is formulated to clean 

grease and oil stains on concrete, brick and masonry. It 
also prepares surfaces for finishing by promoting adhesion 
when staining, sealing or coating. RockSolid Heavy Duty 
Cleaner is suitable for interior and exterior use and is safe 
to use near grass and plants. 

RockSolid Heavy Duty Cleaner is suitable for use on 
garage floors, basements, driveways, carports, patios, 
walkways and pool decks prior to staining, sealing or 
coating. It can be used on freshly poured concrete.  

.PRODUCTS                                                                 . 

SKU Container Size    

293422 1-Gallon Heavy Duty Cleaner 

 PRODUCT FEATURES                                            . 

 Removes oil, grease, tire marks, dirt and stains 

 Cleans surface prior to sealing 

 Designed for use on concrete and masonry 

 PRODUCT APPLICATION                                        . 

READ ALL INSTRUCTIONS CAREFULLY BEFORE 
STARTING PROJECT 

SURFACE PREPARATION 

Proper surface preparation is critical to achieve best 
results. Wipe up excess oil and grease spots. Scrape and 
sweep away dirt and loose contaminants on the surface.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

.PRODUCT APPLICATION (cont.)                           . 

APPLICATION 

RockSolid Heavy Duty Cleaner is ready to use. Do not thin. 
Use only when air (ambient) temperature is between 50-
90°F (10-32°C) and the relative humidity is below 85%. 
Dampen the surface with water. Apply RockSolid Heavy 
Duty Cleaner to the entire floor and allow it to soak into the 
surface for 5-10 minutes, misting the surface as needed to 
keep it damp. Work the product into the surface with a stiff 
bristle brush or broom.  

Rinse the surface thoroughly with water or power wash to 
remove all cleaner residue. Note: If cleaner dries before 
rinsing, apply more cleaner and then scrub and rinse. Use 
a squeegee or broom to remove excess water from the 
surface. A wet/dry shop vacuum can be used. Repeat the 
application as needed for hard-to-remove stains.   

COVERAGE 

Each gallon will cover 200 square feet per gallon.   

DRY TIME 

Dry time is based on 70°F and 50% relative humidity. 
Allow to dry for 24 hours before staining, sealing or 
coating.  

CLEAN-UP 

Wash tools and equipment with soap and warm water.  
Properly dispose of all soiled rags and protect unused 
product from freezing. 

DANGER: CAUSES BURNS TO EYES, SKIN AND IS A 
RESPIRATORY IRRITANT. HARMFUL IF SWALLOWED. 

KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN. 
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.PHYSICAL PROPERTIES                                                                                                                                              . 

Composition Citrus Based Liquid 

Solvent Glycol Ethers, Water 

Weight 
Per Gallon 8.4 lbs. 

Per Liter 1.01 kg 

Volatile Organic Compounds 0 g/l  

Practical Coverage 
at Recommended DFT 

Up to 200 sq.ft./gal.   

Dry Times @ 70-80º F (21-27°C) and 
50% Relative Humidity             

Allow to dry for 24 hours before staining, sealing or coating 

Shelf Life 3 years 

Flash Point >200°F (93°C) 

Safety Information For additional information, see SDS 

 
 
 

 

 

The technical data and suggestions for use contained herein are correct to the best of our knowledge, and offered in good faith. The 

statements of this literature do not constitute a warranty, express, or implied, as to the performance of these products. As conditions and use 

of our materials are beyond our control, we can guarantee these products only to conform to our standards of quality, and our liability, if any, 

will be limited to replacement of defective materials. All technical information is subject to change without notice.  


